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Brickfielder Wines G F Angas Barossa Valley Shiraz 2020  
 

Vintage  2020  
 
Grape Variety   Shiraz 100% 
 
Region  The historic Barossa Valley produces some of the best 

Shiraz in the world thanks to its rich soils, low 
humidity and diverse landscape. 

 
Vineyard  A multi vineyard selection from Eastern slopes and 

Southern parts of the Barossa Valley 
 
Vintage Conditions Below-average winter and spring rainfall resulted in 

very cold mornings in spring, with some frost 
issues across many parts of South Australia. A 
long even growing season with an occasional 
heat spikes gave richness to the resulting 
wines without losing elegance. The warm 
temperatures and lack of rainfall during the 
growing season produced a vintage that 
allowed winemakers and viticulturalists to 
pick all fruit at the optimum flavour ripeness.  

 
Winemaking Picking of fruit began in mid-March, once 

harvested the stems were removed and the 
fruit fermented in stainless steel fermenters. 
A relatively warm ferment to extract the 
plush fruit flavours was followed by 18 
months maturation in seasoned American 
Oak of which 30% was new.  

 
Aroma Freshly sliced panforte – date, fig, with dark 

chocolate and plum that becomes more 
apparent with time in the glass. Immediately 
recognisable American oak, sweet Vanillin 
spices and a propulsion of dried roasted 
almond enhancing not intruding. 

 
Palate Assertive fruit. Dark berries and ripe 

plum/dark couverture chocolate. Spills across 
the palate by means of a coating of fine 
polished tannins. Lingering flavours leave you 
wanting for more. 


